
Joliet Junior College

Bid for Culinary Arts Equipment & Supplies

March 12, 2015 @ 10:00AM

ITEM QNTY DESCRIPTION UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

1 40 MAUVIEL 9.5” ROUND FRY PAN, 

M’COOK MODEL NO. 5213.24
EA

No Bid $52.72 $2,108.83 $66.13 $2,645.20 $55.89 $2,235.60 $54.86 $2,194.40 No Bid No Bid $64.40 $2,576.00

2 40 MAUVIEL 11.8” ROUND FRY PAN, 

M’COOK MODEL NO. 5213.30
EA

No Bid $72.92 $2,916.80 $92.00 $3,680.00 $77.76 $3,110.40 $76.32 $3,052.80 No Bid No Bid $89.60 $3,584.00

3 40 MAUVIEL 1.9QT SAUTE PAN WITH 

LID M’COOK MODEL NO. 5211.21
EA

No Bid $86.39 $3,455.45 $109.25 $4,370.00 $92.34 $3,693.60 $90.63 $3,625.20 No Bid No Bid $106.40 $4,256.00

4 32
MAUVIEL 5.8 QT SAUTE PAN WITH 

LID, M’COOK MODEL NO. 5211.28
EA

No Bid $122.30 $3,913.48 $155.25 $4,968.00 $131.22 $4,199.04 $128.79 $4,121.28 No Bid No Bid $151.20 $4,838.40

5 20 MAUVIEL 1.7 QT CURVED SPLAYED 

SAUTE PAN, M’COOK MODEL NO. 

5212.20

EA

No Bid $59.45 $1,189.08 $74.75 $1,495.00 $63.18 $1,263.60 $62.01 $1,240.20 No Bid No Bid $72.80 $1,456.00

6 20 MAUVIEL 3.0 QT CURVED

SPLAYED SAUTE PAN,

M’COOK MODEL NO. 5212.24
EA

No Bid $77.41 $1,548.18 $97.75 $1,955.00 $82.62 $1,652.40 $81.09 $1,621.80 No Bid No Bid $95.20 $1,904.00

7 20 MAUVIEL .9 QT  CURVED

SPLAYED SAUTE PAN,

M’COOK MODEL NO. 5212.16
EA

No Bid $45.99 $919.75 $57.50 $1,150.00 $48.60 $972.00 $47.70 $954.00 No Bid No Bid $56.00 $1,120.00

8 16 MAUVIEL .9 QT SAUCEPAN

WITH LID, M’ COOK MODEL 

NO. 5210.13

EA

No Bid $57.21 $915.35 $71.88 $1,150.08 $60.75 $972.00 $59.63 $954.08 No Bid No Bid $70.00 $1,120.00

9 16 MAUVIEL 2.7 QT SAUCEPAN

WITH LID, M’ COOK MODEL 

NO.5210.19
EA

No Bid $81.90 $1,310.36 $103.50 $1,656.00 $87.48 $1,399.68 $85.86 $1,373.76 No Bid No Bid $100.80 $1,612.80

10 16 MAUVIEL 3.6 QT SAUCEPAN

WITH LID, M’ COOK MODEL 

NO. 5210.21
EA

No Bid $100.85 $1,613.60 $126.50 $2,024.00 $106.92 $1,710.72 $104.94 $1,679.04 No Bid No Bid $123.20 $1,971.20

11 24 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUTE' PAN, 2-1/2 QUART, 8" 

DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM 

CLAD BOTTOM, NON-

INSULATED HANDLE, NSF, 

IMPORTED,

JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3602

EA

No Bid $77.03 $1,848.67 $88.80 $2,131.20 $77.80 $1,867.20 $76.73 $1,841.52 $78.38 $1,881.12 76.06 $1,825.44 $81.08 $1,945.92

12 24 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUTE' PAN, 4-1/2 QUART, 9-

1/2" DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM 

CLAD BOTTOM, NON- 

INSULATED HANDLE, NSF, 

IMPORTED, JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3604

EA

No Bid $110.27 $2,647.01 $127.15 $3,051.60 $111.39 $2,673.36 $109.86 $2,636.64 $112.22 $2,693.28 108.91 $2,613.84 $116.09 $2,786.16

13 24 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUTE' PAN, 1-1/2 QUART, 6-

1/4" DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, ALUMINUM CLAD 

BOTTOM, NON-INSULATED 

HANDLE, NSF, IMPORTED, 

JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3601

EA

No Bid $69.39 $1,665.47 $80.01 $1,920.24 $70.09 $1,682.16 $69.12 $1,658.88 $70.61 $1,694.64 68.53 $1,644.72 $73.05 $1,753.20

14 2 SET OF (4) FOUR: VOLLRATH

CENTURION PASTA 

BASKETS ITEM # 3158

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION

EA

No Bid $171.48 $342.96 $196.75 $393.50 $172.37 $344.74 $170.00 $340.00 $173.66 $347.32 168.52 $337.04 $179.64 $359.28

15 1 VOLLRATH INTRIGUE

STAINLESS STEEL PASTA 

BASKET, ITEM NO. 68134

EA

No Bid $31.84 $31.84 $36.54 $36.54 $32.01 $32.01 $31.57 $31.57 $32.25 $32.25 31.29 $31.29 $33.36 $33.36

16 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUCE PAN, 2-1/4 QUART, 6-

1/4" DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM 

CLAD BOTTOM, NON- 

INSULATED HANDLE, NSF, 

IMPORTED, JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3702

EA

No Bid $74.07 $2,370.14 $85.39 $2,732.48 $74.81 $2,393.92 $73.77 $2,360.64 $75.36 $2,411.52 73.14 $2,340.48 $77.96 $2,494.72

17 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUCE PAN, 4-1/4 QUART, 8" 

DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM 

CLAD BOTTOM, NON-

INSULATED HANDLE, NSF, 

IMPORTED, JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3704

EA

No Bid $92.02 $2,944.70 $106.09 $3,394.98 $92.94 $2,974.08 $91.66 $2,933.12 $93.63 $2,996.16 90.87 $2,907.84 $96.86 $3,099.52

18 32 CENTURION INDUCTION 

DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL,

WITH ALUMINUM CLAD 

BOTTOM, NSF, IMPORTED, 

JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3202

SAUCE POT, 7 QUART, 9-1/2"

EA

No Bid $116.04 $3,713.14 $133.77 $4,280.64 $117.20 $3,750.40 $115.58 $3,698.56 $118.07 $3,778.24 114.59 $3,666.88 $122.14 $3,908.48

19 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUCE POT, 7 QUART, 9-1/2" 

DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM 

CLAD BOTTOM, NSF, 

IMPORTED, JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3202

EA

No Bid $116.04 $3,713.14 $133.77 $4,280.64 $117.20 $3,750.40 $115.58 $3,698.56 $118.07 $3,778.24 114.59 $3,666.88 $122.14 $3,908.48

20 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUCE POT, 11-1/2 QUART, 

11" DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM 

CLAD BOTTOM, NSF, 

IMPORTED, JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3203

No Bid $141.98 $4,543.40 $163.69 $5,238.08 $143.40 $4,588.80 $141.42 $4,525.44 $144.47 $4,623.04 140.2 $4,486.40 $149.45 $4,782.40

21 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

STOCK POT, 6-1/2 QUART, 8" 

DIA., WITHOUT COVER, 18-

10

STAINLESS STEEL WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM, 

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3101

No Bid $98.33 $3,146.43 $112.82 $3,610.24 $98.84 $3,162.88 $97.47 $3,119.04 $99.57 $3,186.24 96.63 $3,092.16 $103.01 $3,296.32

22 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

STOCK POT, 10-1/2 QUART, 9-

1/2" DIA., WITHOUT COVER,

18-10 STAINLESS STEEL 

WITH ALUMINUM CLAD 

BOTTOM, NSF, IMPORTED, 

JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3103

No Bid $131.70 $4,214.26 $151.11 $4,835.52 $132.39 $4,236.48 $130.56 $4,177.92 $133.37 $4,267.84 129.43 $4,141.76 $137.97 $4,415.04
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23 8 CENTURION INDUCTION

STOCK POT, 25-1/2 QUART, 

12-

1/2" DIA., WITHOUT COVER,

18-10 STAINLESS STEEL 

WITH ALUMINUM CLAD 

BOTTOM, NSF, IMPORTED, 

JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3106

No Bid $250.67 $2,005.34 $287.63 $2,301.04 $251.99 $2,015.92 $248.51 $1,988.08 $253.86 $2,030.88 246.36 $1,970.88 $262.62 $2,100.96

24 8 CENTURION INDUCTION

STOCK POT, 38 QUART, 14" 

DIA., WITHOUT COVER, 18-

10

STAINLESS STEEL WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM,

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3109

No Bid $345.07 $2,760.56 $395.94 $3,167.52 $346.88 $2,775.04 $342.09 $2,736.72 $349.46 $2,795.68 339.14 $2,713.12 $361.51 $2,892.08

25 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

CASSEROLE/BRAZIER PAN, 4-

1/2 QUART, 9-1/2" DIA., 18-10

STAINLESS STEEL, WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM, 

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3304

No Bid $103.74 $3,319.62 $119.03 $3,808.96 $104.28 $3,336.96 $102.84 $3,290.88 $105.05 $3,361.60 101.95 $3,262.40 $108.68 $3,477.76

26 32 CENTURION INDUCTION

CASSEROLE/BRAZIER PAN, 7

QUART, 11" DIA., 18-10

STAINLESS STEEL, WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM, 

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3307

No Bid $133.68 $4,277.73 $153.39 $4,908.48 $134.38 $4,300.16 $132.53 $4,240.96 $135.38 $4,332.16 131.38 $4,204.16 $140.05 $4,481.60

27 24 CENTURION INDUCTION

CASSEROLE/BRAZIER PAN,

10-1/2 QUART, 12-1/2" DIA., 

18-

10 STAINLESS STEEL, WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM, 

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3310

No Bid $199.35 $4,784.46 $228.74 $5,489.76 $200.39 $4,809.36 $197.63 $4,743.12 $201.88 $4,845.12 195.92 $4,702.08 $208.85 $5,012.40

28 12 CENTURION INDUCTION

CASSEROLE/BRAZIER PAN, 

20

QUART, 15-3/4" DIA., 18-10

STAINLESS STEEL, WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM, 

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3320

No Bid $307.68 $3,692.16 $353.04 $4,236.48 $309.29 $3,711.48 $305.03 $3,660.36 $311.59 $3,739.08 302.39 $3,628.68 $322.34 $3,868.08

29 6 CENTURION INDUCTION

CASSEROLE/BRAZIER PAN,

28-1/2 QUART, 17-3/4" DIA., 

18-

10 STAINLESS STEEL, WITH 

ALUMINUM CLAD BOTTOM, 

NSF, IMPORTED, JACOB'S 

PRIDE COLLECTION; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 3328

No Bid $412.99 $2,477.94 $473.87 $2,843.22 $415.16 $2,490.96 $409.43 $2,456.58 $418.25 $2,509.50 405.89 $2,435.34 $432.67 $2,596.02

30 24 CENTURION INDUCTION

SAUCE POT, 16-3/4 QUART, 

12-

1/2" DIA., 18-10 STAINLESS 

STEEL, WITH ALUMINUM

CLAD BOTTOM, NSF, 

IMPORTED, JACOB'S PRIDE 

COLLECTION; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 3204

No Bid $221.31 $5,311.37 $253.94 $6,094.56 $222.47 $5,339.28 $219.40 $5,265.60 $224.13 $5,379.12 217.51 $5,220.24 $231.86 $5,564.64

31 3 MIRAGE INDUCTION SOUP

RETHERMALIZER, 7 QUART, 

LED PUSH BUTTON 

CONTROLS, TEMPERATURE 

CONTROL IN F OR C, (4) 

SOUP PRESETS, STIR 

INDICATOR, LOCKING 

CONTROLS FUNCTION, 

INCLUDES: INDUCTION 

READY INSET & INSET 

COVER, NATURAL & BLACK 

FINISH, 800W, 6.7

AMPS, NEMA 5-15P, 

120V/60/1- PH, CULUS, NSF, 

FCC, IMPORTED; VOLLRATH 

MODEL NO. 7470110

*PLEASE INCLUDE 

VOLLRATH INDUCTION- 

READY INSET

No Bid $386.07 $1,158.20 $442.98 $1,328.94 $388.09 $1,164.27 $416.02 $1,248.06 $390.98 $1,172.94 379.42 $1,138.26 $404.46 $1,213.38

32 6 7 QUART INDUCTION 

READY

INSERT; VOLLRATH MODEL 

NO. 88184

No Bid $16.55 $99.32 $113.95 $683.70 $16.64 $99.84 $17.84 $107.04 $16.76 $100.56 16.27 $97.62 $17.34 $104.04

33 16 SKIMMER - 6" BLADE, ONE-

PIECE CONSTRUCTION, 

HEAVY DUTY 18/8 

STAINLESS STEEL, MIRROR 

FINISH BLADE, SATIN 

FINISH HANDLE, 6" (14.24 

CM)

BLADE,

12-5/8" (32.1 CM) HANDLE 

LENGTH, IMPORTED; 

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 

K6545

No Bid $13.08 $209.31 No Bid $13.15 $210.40 $14.09 $225.44 $13.25 $212.00 12.85 $205.60 $13.70 $219.20

34 24 WEAR-EVER® ALUMINUM

FRY PAN, 8" (20 CM), WITH 

EVER-SMOOTH™ 

CERAMIGUARD® II NON- 

STICK COATING, 

FEATURING REMOVABLE 

COOL HANDLE® SILICONE 

INSULATED HANDLE, 

HANDLE RATED AT

450° FOR STOVETOP OR 

OVEN USE, 5-3/4" (14 CM) 

BOTTOM DIAMETER, 1-7/8"H 

(4.8 CM), 10 GA. NSF, MADE 

IN U.S.A.;

VOLLRATH MODEL NO. 

K1636

No Bid $24.24 $581.84 $146.56 $3,517.44 $24.26 $582.24 $18.11 $434.64 $24.44 $830.96 23.72 $569.28 $19.14 $459.36

35 6 BUTANE STOVE COVER-UP,

STAINLESS STEEL WITH 

STAINLESS STEEL GRATES, 

FITS MOST STANDARD 

STOVES, INSIDE 

DIMENSIONS MEASURE 10-

1/2"L X 3-1/2"H X

13-3/4"W; EASTERN 

TABLETOP MFG. MODEL NO.

3265G-SS

No Bid $269.29 $1,615.74 $301.82 $1,810.92 $283.45 $1,700.70 $278.20 $1,669.20 No Bid 285.40 $1,712.40 $286.07 $1,716.42

#33: Vollrath 46970

#34: EZ4008
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36 6 DOUBLE BUTANE STOVE

COVER-UP, STAINLESS 

STEEL, STAINLESS STEEL 

GRATES; EASTERN 

TABLETOP MFG. MODEL NO. 

3267G-SS

No Bid $550.26 $3,301.56 No Bid $584.79 $3,508.74 $573.96 $3,443.76 No Bid 578.37 $3,470.22 $590.20 $3,541.20

37 6 REVO COOKING AND

WARMING STATION, 17-

1/2"L X 9"W X 7"H, 

RECTANGULAR, WITH 

GRILL & ALUMINUM 

GRIDDLE TOPS, STERNO 

HEAT, GRATE TOP, SIDES 

WITH SWIRL FINISH, ALL 

STAINLESS STEEL; EASTERN 

TABLETOP MFG. MODEL NO.

3266

No Bid $292.00 $1,752.00 $327.75 $1,966.50 $307.80 $1,846.80 $302.10 $1,812.60 No Bid 309.08 $1,854.48 $310.65 $1,863.90

38 6 REVO COOKING/WARMING

STATION, 13" DIA. X 7"H, 

ROUND, WITH GRILL & 

ALUMINUM GRIDDLE TOPS, 

STERNO HEAT, SIDES WITH 

SWIRL FINISH ALL 

STAINLESS STEEL; EASTERN 

TABLETOP MFG. MODEL NO. 

3260

No Bid $282.00 $1,692.00 $316.25 $1,897.50 $297.00 $1,782.00 $291.50 $1,749.00 No Bid 298.58 $1,791.48 $299.75 $1,798.50

39 6 GRILL TOP, 38" X 13",

RECTANGULAR, 

COUNTERTOP, HEAVY 

DUTY, WITH STAND, FITS (2) 

TWO BUTANE BURNERS OR 

SEVERAL STERNO CANS, 

INTERCHANGEABLE TOPS, 

ALUMINUM GRIDDLE, 

SQUARE LEGS, STAINLESS 

STEEL; EASTERN TABLETOP 

MFG. MODEL NO. 3263G

No Bid $758.24 $4,549.44 $860.20 $5,161.20 $807.84 $4,847.04 $792.88 $4,757.28 No Bid 795.23 $4,771.38 $815.32 $4,891.92

40 24 SKIMMER 5X6-1/2" SQUARE

MESH 12 EA/CS; 

TABLECRAFT PRODUCTS 

MODEL NO. K4178

No Bid $3.10 $74.29 No Bid $2.87 $68.88 $3.49 $83.76 $3.52 $84.48 2.66 $63.84 $3.29 $78.96

41 4 BOWL NAPPY 10 OZ

POLYCARB BLK 48/CS; 

CARLISLE MODEL NO. 

1033345

No Bid $52.95 $211.80 No Bid $73.60 $294.40 $58.08 $232.32 $73.92 $295.68 No Bid $85.44 $341.76

42 12 BOX FOOD 12X18X9 CLR 6

EA/CS; CARLISLE MODEL 

NO.

1061207

No Bid $27.85 $334.19 $166.30 $1,995.60 $13.90 $166.80 $16.45 $197.40 $25.38 $304.56 No Bid $20.58 $246.96

43 12 LID F/12X18" FOOD BOX CLR 

6

EA/CS; CARLISLE MODEL 

NO.

1061707

No Bid $10.20 $122.43 $60.92 $731.04 $5.09 $61.08 $6.03 $72.36 $8.85 $106.20 No Bid $7.54 $90.48

44 2 BASKET FRY 8 SLOT TACO 2

EA/CS; PRONTO PRODUCTS 

MODEL NO. 1042483

No Bid $42.98 $85.63 No Bid No Bid $18.12 $36.24 No Bid No Bid $12.30 $24.60

45 10 MILL FOOD 12-1/4" SS;

PADERNO WORLD CUISINE 

MODEL NO. 42570-32

No Bid $124.07 $1,240.75 $120.18 $1,201.80 $111.19 $1,111.90 $104.24 $1,042.40 $109.73 $1,097.30 No Bid $123.31 $1,233.10

46 16 RICER LARGE HEAVY DUTY

SS 6 EA/CS; ADMIRAL CRAFT 

MODEL NO. PR-15

No Bid $60.54 $968.62 $54.68 $874.88 $47.93 $766.88 $46.45 $743.20 $47.43 $758.88 40.80 $652.80 $55.11 $881.76

47 8 RACK 11 PAN END LOAD 

68"H

ALUM; TEXAS 

DISTRIBUTION CENTER 

MODEL NO. E3007

No Bid $204.31 $1,634.48 No Bid No Bid $141.70 $1,133.60 No Bid No Bid $148.64 $1,189.12

48 8 RACK PAN END LOAD 18 

PAN

CAP'Y; TEXAS 

DISTRIBUTION CENTER 

MODEL NO. E3006

No Bid $207.12 $1,656.97 No Bid No Bid $147.15 $1,177.20 No Bid No Bid $113.70 $909.60

49 32 CASSEROLE TRI-PLY 1 QT 

W/

HANDL 10 EA/CS; 

TABLECRAFT PRODUCTS 

MODEL NO. 1103099

No Bid $26.76 $856.30 No Bid $26.28 $840.96 No Bid No Bid 23.94 $766.08 $57.60 $1,843.20

50 32 LID TRI-PLY 5-7/8" SS 20

EA/CS; TABLECRAFT 

PRODUCTS MODEL NO.

1103100

No Bid $11.18 $357.87 No Bid $10.95 $350.40 No Bid No Bid 9.98 $319.36 $24.00 $768.00

51 32 BOARD CUTTING SAF-T-

GRIP

15X20" 6 EA/CS; SAN JAMAR 

MODEL NO. 

CBGW152012WH

No Bid $21.85 $699.20 No Bid $21.34 $682.88 $21.44 $686.08 $78.17 $2,501.44 17.05 $545.60 $24.68 $789.76

52 32 BOARD CUTTING SAF-T-

GRIP

9X12" 6 EA/CS; SAN JAMAR 

MODEL NO. CBGW912WH

No Bid $10.22 $327.04 No Bid $9.60 $307.20 $9.64 $308.48 $35.15 $1,124.80 7.15 $228.80 $11.10 $355.20

53 1 BOARD CUTTING SAF-T-

GRIP

15X20”; SAN JAMAR MODEL 

NO. CBGW152012BL

No Bid $22.73 $22.73 $25.01 $25.01 $21.34 $21.34 $21.44 $21.44 $21.24 $21.24 17.61 $17.61 $24.68 $24.68

54 2 BOARD CUTTING SAF-T-

GRIP

9X12"; SAN JAMAR MODEL 

NO. CBGW912BL

No Bid $10.22 $20.44 $11.25 $22.24 $9.60 $19.20 $9.64 $19.28 $9.55 $19.10 7.14 $14.28 $11.10 $22.20

55 2 LXE DISHWASHER,

UNDERCOUNTER, 23-

15/16"W X 23-9/16"D X 32-

1/2"H, HIGH

TEMPERATURE SANITIZING, 

(32) RACKS/HR, FRESH

WATER RINSE, .74 

GAL/RACK, DELIME 

NOTIFICATION,

AUTO CHEMICAL PRIMING, 

SERVICE DIAGNOSTICS, 

DETERGENT & RINSE AID 

PUMP, 120/208-240(3W)/60/1- 

PH,

30.5 AMPS, CULUS, NSF, 

ENERGY STAR®; HOBART 

MODEL NO. 1047521

EACH TO INCLUDE:

*STANDARD WARRANTY - 1- 

YEAR PARTS, LABOR & 

TRAVEL TIME DURING 

NORMAL WORKING HOURS

*CORD-PWRKIT-LXEH 

POWER CORD KIT, FOR 

120/208-

240(3W)/60/1 VOLTAGE

*WTRHAM-ARREST WATER 

No Bid $6,288.26 $12,576.52 No Bid $6,448.18 $12,896.36 $6,933.87 $6,933.87 $7,214.02 $14,428.04 No Bid $6,735.75 $13,471.50



Joliet Junior College

Bid for Culinary Arts Equipment & Supplies

March 12, 2015 @ 10:00AM

ITEM QNTY DESCRIPTION UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Clean X-Press Edward Don & Co. Gordon Food Service TriMark Marlinn Sam Tell & Son Pueblo Hotel Supply Co. RD America Culinary Depot

56 1 RONDO MANOMAT PASTRY

SHEETER, A-FRAME, FLOOR 

MODEL, ELECTRIC, 25" W 

INFEED CONVEYOR BELT, 

TABLE 107-3/32" L, 

ADJUSTABLE SPEED 

CONVEYOR, ADJUSTABLE 

ROLLER GAP, SCRAPER 

SYSTEM, PAN TRAY, 

STAINLESS STEEL FRAME 

WITH HARD CHROME 

ROLLERS, STAINLESS STEEL 

BASE, 220V/60/3-PH, UL; 

GEMINI BAKERY MODEL 

NO. SSO675 TO INCLUDE:

*ONE YEAR SERVICE & 

PARTS WARRANTY-WITHIN 

CONTINENTAL U.S.

*START-UP – WITHIN 

CONTINENTAL U.S.

*1-PHASE ELECTRICAL

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46,273.89 $46,273.89 No Bid $28,221.64 $28,221.64

57 6 20 QT., BOWL, STAINLESS

STEEL; HOBART MODEL NO.

2E5948

No Bid $309.02 $1,854.09 No Bid No Bid $343.73 $2,062.38 $347.66 $2,085.96 No Bid $333.31 $1,999.86

58 19 MIXER COMMERCIAL 8 QT

NICKEL PEARL; 

KITCHENAID MODEL NO. 

KSM8990NP

No Bid $515.00 $9,785.00 No Bid No Bid $514.10 $9,767.90 No Bid No Bid $682.45 $12,966.55

59 6 ROLLER PASTA & CUTTER

ATTACHMEN 2 EA/CS; 

KITCHENAID MODEL NO.

1009019

No Bid $147.14 $882.84 No Bid No Bid $158.99 $953.94 No Bid No Bid $206.58 $1,239.48

60 3 SERVING PLATE, 12-1/4",

BAROQUE™ PATTERN, 

INTERNATIONAL SHAPE, 

BONE CHINA BODY; 

SYRACUSE CHINA MODEL 

NO. 911191020

No Bid $361.81 $1,085.42 No Bid $379.37 $1,138.11 $389.91 $1,169.73 No Bid No Bid $526.91 $1,580.73

61 1 60 GALLON STAINLESS 

STEEL

HEATED SOAK TANK; H&K 

INTERNATIONAL, CLEAN X- 

PRESS  MODEL #CXP006

$2,574.00 $2,574.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

62 2 CLEAN X-PRESS  X-SOAK 

25#

DETERGENT

$125.00 $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

63 2 CAMBRO 300MPC, 

INSULATED

FOOD SERVERS, NON- 

ELECTRIC, BRICK RED (402)

No Bid $230.21 $460.42 $256.16 $512.32 $176.25 $352.50 $175.42 $350.84 $210.50 $421.00 No Bid $244.59 $489.18

64 1 CAMBRO 300 DIV, THERMO

BARRIER

No Bid $34.43 $34.43 $38.81 $38.81 $35.61 $35.61 $35.44 $35.44 $35.44 $35.44 No Bid $41.18 $41.18

65 2 CAMBRO 1210 PW,

CAMWARMER

No Bid $91.87 $183.74 No Bid $95.00 $190.00 $94.57 $189.14 $94.57 $189.14 No Bid $109.89 $219.78

66 1 CAMBRO CP 1220 GN,

CAMCHILLER, FULL-SIZE

No Bid $61.97 $61.97 $69.86 $69.86 $64.10 $64.10 $63.79 $63.79 $63.79 $63.79 No Bid $74.12 $74.12

67 1 CAMBRO CD300, WHEELED

BASE WITH “A” CASTERS

No Bid $144.59 $144.59 $163.01 $163.01 $149.55 $149.55 $148.84 $148.84 $148.84 $148.84 No Bid $172.94 $172.94

Total $2,824.00 $130,342.39 $115,849.73 $116,704.81 $169,371.29 $86,685.38 $77,110.72 $172,299.08

Yes

YesYesYesYes Yes Yes Yes

30 days

No

30 days from receipt of PO

Yes

14 Days ARO

Yes

Certification of Contract Bidder

3/31/15

YesYes

Yes

Estimated Delivery Date

Addendum Acknowledgment

As needed

Yes

4-6 weeks after receipt of 

PO

Yes


